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Re: Quote for Order #2440078
3 messages

Deborah Fry <deborah.f@pfstarwal .com>
To: cs@Ilpsinc.com

ATTENTION LIMIKA!!

Hello Limika,

Thank you so much for sending the quote.
Owner is not ready to do 3 year right now, BUT
he did agree to 1 yr at the $89.50 price for
all 7 of our clubs

Please send all invoices to me at:
invoices@pfstarwal.com
I pay all the bills from our corporate office

Here are the addresses for all our clubs

planet Fitness
Planet Fitness
4613 NE Sunset Blvd
18129 E Valley Hwy
Renton, Wa 98059
Kent, Wa 98032

Customer Service <cs@Ilpsinc.com>

Planet Fitness
planet Fitness

1346 NE State St
14025 NE Woodinville Duvall Rd

Marysville, Wa 98270
Woodinville, Wa 98072

Thank you so much for all your assistance!
Have a great day!

Regards!
Deborah  Fry
Assistant Off ice  Manager/Accounts Payable
Planet  Fitness
Lucky Star Enterprises
deborah.f@pfstarwal.com
Office  -  253-243-6005
Fax  -  253-277-4056

Wed, Nov 10, 2021  at 6:34 PM

Planet Fitness                    planet Fitness
planet Fitness

24044104th Aye se        27073 Pacific Hwy s
16913 SE 270th PI

Ste A101                               Des Moines, Wa 98198
Covington, Wa 98042

Kent, Wa 98030

On Wed,  Nov 10, 2021  at 11:14 AM <noreply@Ilpsinc.com> wrote:

The Quote for the Order #2440078 is attached to this email.

If you have any questions, please contact Customer Service at 877-321-4144.

Thank you,
LLPS'  ,nc.


